
   Wodonga
Dog Rescue 

Adoption Fee: $350
All dogs rehomed through WDR are vet checked,
desexed, microchipped, C5 vaccinated, �ea
treated, wormed and registered with Wodonga Council

Name:
Sex:
Age:

Breed:

Boof
Male
Approx 3 years
Masti� x 

For More Information & to Meet me

or Phone Peta on 0407 538 922  

Email: peta@wodongadogrescue.org.au

Boof came into care in need of care. His head was 
desperately in need of treatment from a hot spot 
that had spread across most of his head and down 
behind his ears. His owner had to leave his home 
and le� the dog with someone else who couldn't 
care for him. He had to be sedated to be able to 
clean the wound but he is now almost fully 
recovered and looking good.

I don't think he had been inside before but he has 
been inside a couple of times and he is so sweet 
and quiet. He didn't like the slippery �oor to start 
with but he is ok with that now. He loves his food 
and has put on quite a bit of weight. He is very 
sooky and just love cuddles. He walks well on the 
lead, but not too sure about the car. He has the 
basic commands and is easy to train as he is very 
food orientated.  He is good with dogs but not sure 
about cats and he is good with children.  He can get 
a bit snappy with other dogs around tea time so I 
crate him while getting his tea ready. He is crate 
trained.


